COUNTY OF ULSTER
JEN METZGER
County Executive

ULSTER COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

EDWARD M. JORDAN
Director of General Services

CONTRACT AWARD INFORMATION

Title: SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

BID NUMBER: RFB-UC24-047

Contract Period: JANUARY 30, 2025 — JANUARY 31, 2026
Authorized Users: ALL

View Specifications at: http://www.empirestatebidsystem.com/

Submit Inquiries to:
Name: FRANCES WU, Principal Buyer

Phone: 845-340-3408
Fax: 845-340-3434

Email: frwu@co.ulster.ny.us

If you intend to Piggyback off of this bid please contact Buyer first.

BID DESCRIPTION

The purpose of this bid is to establish pricing for the purchase of janitorial supplies by various Ulster
County Departments and others authorized by law.

NYS Preferred Source and GSA options have been provided for items not awarded or when the

preferred source option meets Preferred Source price standards (up to 15% above the awarded

vendor price), based on available prices as of January 1, 2025. Please note for Corcraft “inside
delivery” pricing was used. (Loading dock pricing is shown and typically $10 less). Preferred Source
and GSA options are indicated by ** on this list and are not awarded as part of this RFB. For more

information about use of Preferred Sources go to
https://ogs.ny.gov/system/files/documents/2022/09/list-of-preferred-source-offerings.pdf and
https://ogs.ny.gov/procurement/nys-procurement-bulletin-preferred-source-guidelines.




AWARDED SUPPLIERS

SUPPLIER
SUPPLIER INFORMATION CONTACT INFO
Deanna McGee — PO’s Email: eamorders@aramsco.com
ARAMSCO Keith Sult — Bids ksult@aramsco.com

Contract #B24-047A

11 Harding St.

Phone: (845) 346-4700

Middletown, NY 10940 Fax: (845) 346-4717
CAROLINAS PAPER Gregory Alford Email:
SUPPLY 701 Rainbow Drive carolinaspapersupply@gmail.com
Contract #B24-047B Kannapolis, NC 28081 Phone: (704) 449-0797
HEAD TO HEELS Subbarayan Pochi Email: cservice@headtoheels.net
(Agni Enterprises) 9021 SW 94™ Street, Unit 510 Phone: (305) 712-6653
Contract #B24-047C Miami, FL 33176 Fax: (888) 592-3667

HILL & MARKES
Contract #B24-047D

Angie Richards — sales
Customer Service - Bids
1997 State Hwy
Amsterdam, NY 12010

Email: arichards@hillnmarkes.com
info@hillnmarkes.com
Phone: (518) 774-4447

Fax: (518) 842-1207

IMPERIAL DADE
Contract #B24-047E

MJ Harkins
255 Route 1&9
Jersey City, NJ 07306

Email: mjharkins@imperialdade.com
Phone: (914) 403-6275
Fax: (201) 437-7081

INTERBORO
Contract #B24-047F

Abraham Jeremias
114 Bracken Road
Montgomery, NY 12529

abraham@jinterboropackaging.com
Phone: (845) 782-6800
Fax: (845) 781-2450

UNITED SALES
Contract #B24-047G

Rachel Brach
5902 14™ Ave., Unit 107
Brooklyn, NY 11219

Email: bids@unitedsalesusa.com
Phone: (718) 709-5900
Fax: (718) 709-7705

WB MASON
Contract #B24-047H

Leanne Wood
22 Veteran’s Lane
Plattsburgh, NY 12901

Email: Leanne.wood@wbmason.com
Phone: (508) 436-5722
Fax: (518) 561-4584

PREFERRED SOURCES and GSA Contractor

SUPPLIER

SUPPLIER INFORMATION CONTACT INFO
www.corcraft.ny.gov
CORCRAFT CORCRAFT Phone: (800) 436-6321 x2605
Fax: (518) 436-6007
NYS PROGRAM FOR WWW.nySpsp.org
NEW YORKERS WHO NYSPSP Phone: (800) 421-9010
ARE BLIND Fax: (518) 456-3587
www.nysid.org
NYSTIPII\II;) II)JISST:};IEE]E OR NYSID Phone: (518) 463-9706
Fax: (518) 463-9708
Liz Bouren .
WEXFORD LABS 325 Leffingwell Avenue Email: orders@wexfordlabs.com

Kirkwood, MO 63122

Phone: (314) 966-4134




ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047 SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026)

Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items.

Prepared 2/14/2025

+PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

MANUFAC- MANUFACTURER NIT SIZE # UNIT TCASE PRICE
*ITEM # DESCRIPTION UFAC BRAND UFACTU VENDOR SKU v S UNITS C' S ¢ VENDOR
TURER PART NUMBER (e.g., gal., qt.)] PER CASE | (min. order)
Category A: Cleaning, Facility Maintenance Chemicals, Disinfectants, and Sanitizers
CAROLINAS PAPER
A.l WHITE VINEGAR, GALLON Uline Uline S-25034 S$-25034 GAL 6 S 16.00 SUPPLY
AGNI -
A.2 PEROXIDE, QUART CUM 1000035170 QT (3202) 12 S 71.16
HEAD-TO-HEELS
AGNI -
A3 PEROXIDE, GALLON HDX A0013 GAL 4 S 68.28
HEAD-TO-HEELS
AGNI -
A.4 BAKING SODA, 320Z CDC3320001140 | QT (32 02) 12 S 48.20
HEAD-TO-HEELS
ECO-ME WOOD POLISH LEMON FRESH, 16 CAROLINAS PAPER
A.5 Eco-Me Eco-Me ECOM-WPLF16 ECOM-WPLF16 16 Oz 12 S 110.00
0OZ (NO SUBS) SUPPLY
PURELL PROFESSIONAL SURFACE GOJO
A7 DISINFECTANT, GALLON G0J343204 (NO Industries Purell 3432-04 GO0J434204 GAL 4 S 35.99 WB MASON
SUBS)
PURELL PROFESSIONAL SURFACE RTU GOJO
A.8 SPRAY, Industries Purell 3342-06 GO0J334206 QT (32 02) 6 S 22.89 WB MASON
QUART G0J334206 (NO SUBS)
LYSOL HYDROGEN PEROXIDE MULTI Reckitt
A.9 Benckiser Lysol 19200-89289 RAC89289CT QT (32 02) 9 S 50.82 IMPERIAL BAG
PURPOSE CLEANER 19200-89289 (NO SUBS) Group
PURELL PROFESSIONAL FOOD SURFACE GOJO
A.10 DISINFECTANT, GALLON G0J434104 (NO Industries Purell 4341-04 GO0J434104 GAL 4 S 35.99 WB MASON
SUBS)
PURELL PROFESSIONAL FOOD SURFACE RTU GOJO
A.11 . Purell 3341-06 G0J334106CT QT (32 02) 6 S 22.89 WB MASON
SPRAY, QUART G0J334106 (NO SUBS) Industries
CREAM MULTI-SURFACE CLEANSER, Enviro Washroom
A.13 WASHROOM CLEANSER . ES53 ES536CLEANSER | QT (32 02) 6 S 38.50 IMPERIAL BAG
Solution Cleanser
ENVIRO SOLUTIONS ES53 (NO SUBS)
A.14 CALCIUM, LIME, AND RUST REMOVER JEL CLR BATH32PROEA |JELBATH32PROEA| QT (32 02) 1 S 7.54 WB MASON
*|tem #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
1of10

** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering.



ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047 SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026)

Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items.

Prepared 2/14/2025

+PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

MANUFAC- MANUFACTURER UNIT SIZE # UNITS TCASE PRICE
*ITEM # DESCRIPTION BRAND VENDOR SKU . VENDOR
TURER PART NUMBER (e.g., gal., qt.)] PER CASE | (min. order)
CAROLINAS PAPER
A.15 GRANITE AND STONE CLEANER Weiman Weiman WMN 109 WMN 109 2407 6 S 45.00 SUPPLY
Earth Friendly
A.16 WHITEBOARD CLEANER Products ECOS PL98696 EFPPL98696 QT (32 02) 6 S 26.82 WB MASON
. $21.90
A.17** GLASS CLEANER -GALLON Corcraft Green Line | UOU1GRGCRTUO04 | U0O1GRGCRTUO04 GAL 4 $11.90 Dock CORCRAFT**
Gl
A.17 GLASS CLEANER -GALLON Spartan CIe:rS;r 383504 3835 GAL 4 S 42.00 IMPERIAL BAG
. $32.50
A.18%* GLASS CLEANER - SPRAY (NON-AEROSOL) Corcraft Green Line| UO1GRGCRTU32 | UO1GRGCRTU32 QT (32 02) 12 $22.50 Dock CORCRAFT**
CAROLINAS PAPER
A.19 URINE DIGESTER AND ODOR NEUTRALIZER Betco Push 1331200BTC 1331200BTC QT (32 02) 12 S 81.00 SUPPLY
SIMONIZ GREENSCENE CAROLINAS PAPER
A.24 HEAVY DUTY LIQUID DEGREASER Simoniz USA | Simoniz G1165005 G1165005 GAL 4 S 76.00 SUPPLY
CONCENTRATE G1165004 (NO SUBS)
SIMPLE GREEN INDUSTRIAL CLEANER AND Sunshi Simpl
A.25 unshine 'MPI€ 1 smP13005CT $G13005 GAL 6 $ 68.40| IMPERIAL BAG
DEGREASER SMP13005CT (NO SUBS) Makers, Inc. Green
A.28 CARPET SPOT CLEANER DIVERSEY DIVERSEY 101109763 DIV101109763 QT (32 02) 12 S 49.92| HILL & MARKES
National National
A.30 NEUTRAL FLOOR CLEANER - 1 GALLON Chemical Chemical 405029 NCL405029 GAL 4 S 34.48 WB MASON
Labs Labs
NCL BARE BONES LIQUIFYING STRIPPER | auonal | National
A.31 Chemical Chemical NCL105829 NCL105829 GAL 4 S 52.93 WB MASON
GALLON NCL105829 (NO SUBS)
Labs Labs
NCL IMPRESSIONS FLOOR-FINISH National - ~National
A.32 Chemical Chemical NCL055029 NCL055029 GAL 4 S 59.07 WB MASON
GALLON NCL055029 (NO SUBS)
Labs Labs
NON-CHLORINE LAUNDRY BLEACH - 1 43.50
A.35%* Corcraft Green Line UO1GRXB004 UO1GRXB004 GAL 4 ? CORCRAFT**
GALLON $33.50 Dock
*|tem #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 20f10




ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047 SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026) Prepared 2/14/2025

Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items. +PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

MANUFAC- MANUFACTURER UNIT SIZE # UNITS | tCASE PRICE
*ITEM # DESCRIPTION BRAND VENDOR SKU . VENDOR
TURER PART NUMBER (e.g., gal., qt.)] PER CASE | (min. order)
OFF!
INSECT REPELLENT DEEP WOODS OFF
A.36 SCJOHNSON [ FAMILY 654458 SIN654458 6 0Z BOTTLE 12 S 95.04| HILL & MARKES
(w/DEET, NON-AEROSOL) 607 CARE
DISINFECTING WIPES SMALL
The Clorox Clorox .
A.37 [CANISTER CLOROX ECOCLEAN 75 CT 60605 60605 CLOX60605 |cCanister of 75 6 S 33.73| IMPERIAL BAG
Company EcoClean
(NO SUBS)
DISINFECTING WIPES BUCKET Purefexion Canister of WEXFORD LABS**
A.38** Wexford Labs| Disinfectin | 3230C--160-CS 3230C-160-CS 12 $ 118.15
(LARGE CANISTER) } 160 GS-07F-057AA
g Wipes
PURELL HEALTHCARE SURFACE G0l
A.40 DISINFECTANT RTU SPRAY, Industries Purell 3340-06 G0J0334006 QT 6 S 40.02| IMPERIAL BAG
QUART G0J334006 (NO SUBS)
Category B: Janitorial Supplies and Equipment
B.1 SQUEEGIE,12" WINDOW Janico Squeegie 4810 BOWLSWAB EA 1 S 5.59| IMPERIAL BAG
., |Hygen Mop
B.2 TELESCOPING HANDLE FOR SQUEEGIE Rubbermaid Handle FGQ75500YL00 0cQ755 EA 1 S 15.18| IMPERIAL BAG
Procter &
B.3 MR CLEAN MAGIC ERASER (NO SUBS) Gamble Mr. Clean <>55> USL<>55> BOX OF 6 ; S 34.92| HILL & MARKES
PUMIE 12 SCOURING STICK, GRAY PUMICE, | U.S. Pumi .
B.4 UM pumie 559004 PUM12B EA 1 $ 2.25| IMPERIAL BAG
5% X% X 11/4 (NO SUBS) Company
SWIFFER DUSTERS HEAVY DUTY 6 FT. SUPER| Procter &
B.5 rocter Swiffer | 37000773269 820748 EA 1 $ 9.99| IMPERIAL BAG
EXTENDER STARTER KIT (NO SUBS) Gamble
SWIFFER DUSTERS HEAVY DUTY 6 FT. SUPER Procter &
B.6 EXTENDER REFILLS (OR EQUIV) MUST FIT Gamble Swiffer 37000214595 PG21459 BOX OF 10 4 S 42.00| IMPERIAL BAG
Swiffer 77326
Imperial Victoria
B.7 MEDIUM DUTY SCRUB PADS 9X6 Dr;de Bay Med 7100203200 VBI6MSP EA 20 $ 6.40| IMPERIAL BAG
Duty Scour
B.8 HEAVY DUTY SCRUB PADS 9X6 Americo Brightline 510163 16048961 EA 60 S 21.60 ARAMSCO
*|tem #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
3 0of 10

** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering.




ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047 SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026)

Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items.

Prepared 2/14/2025

+PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

MANUFAC- MANUFACTURER UNIT SIZE # UNITS | tCASE PRICE
*ITEM # DESCRIPTION BRAND VENDOR SKU i VENDOR
TURER PART NUMBER (e.g., gal., qt.)] PER CASE | (min. order)
Imperial Victoria
B.9 MED-HEAVY DUTY 6" X 3.5" SCRUB SPONGE Dr;de Bay Med 7100203125 VB74MSS EA 20 S 17.92| IMPERIAL BAG
Duty
STAINLESS STEEL SCRUBBING PADS SCOTCH CAROLINAS PAPER
B.11 Boardwalk | Boardwalk| BWKSCRUBBER BWKSCRUBBER EA 72 S 35.00
BRITE #84- 49 GRAM MIN SUPPLY
Textile Waste Textile
B.12 BOX OF COTTON T-SHIRT RAGS Supb| Waste 2190176 TWY2190176 251B 1 S 55.53 WB MASON
pply Supply
WAFFLE WEAVE MICROFIBER CLEANING AGNI
B.13 - C6228B_60 EA Blue 60 51.66
CLOTH 16X16 - AT LEAST 6 ASSORTED | ue S HEAD-TO-HEELS
COLORS - PLEASE SPECIFY
WAFFLE WEAVE MICROFIBER CLEANING AGNI
B.13 - C6228G_60 EA G 60 55.21
CLOTH 16X16 - AT LEAST 6 ASSORTED | reen S HEAD-TO-HEELS
COLORS - PLEASE SPECIFY
WAFFLE WEAVE MICROFIBER CLEANING AGNI
B.13 - LEP8251616Y EA Yellow 50 53.14
CLOTH 16X16 - AT LEAST 6 ASSORTED ellow S HEAD-TO-HEELS
COLORS - PLEASE SPECIFY
WAFFLE WEAVE MICROFIBER CLEANING .
B.13 CLOTH 16X16 - AT LEAST 6 ASSORTED LEP8251616R_50 EA Red (Pink S 53.14 AGNI -
’ - Tone) 50 ' HEAD-TO-HEELS
COLORS - PLEASE SPECIFY
WAFFLE WEAVE MICROFIBER CLEANING LEP8251616KCHP AGNI
B.13 - EA Black 200 127.63
CLOTH 16X16 - AT LEAST 6 ASSORTED 200 ac S HEAD-TO-HEELS
COLORS - PLEASE SPECIFY _
WAFFLE WEAVE MICROFIBER CLEANING LEPS2516160R 2 AGNI
B.13 - - EA o 200 137.55
CLOTH 16X16 - AT LEAST 6 ASSORTED 00 range S HEAD-TO-HEELS
COLORS - PLEASE SPECIFY
ODOR ELIMINATING/ DEODORIZING URINAL
B.15 SCREENS, THE WAVE (OR EQUIV), APPLE Boardwalk | Boardwalk 1001 BWK1001 EA 12 S 11.98 WB MASON
SPICE or MINT PREFERRED
JANISAN ECO FRESH HANG TAGS W/O Fresh EHT72-CM HTEO121072MO1S
B.16 SUCTION (NO SUBS), APPLE SPICE, MINT, OR Products Janisan (cucumber- A EA 12 S 16.50 IMPERIAL BAG
WINTERGREEN PREFERRED melon)
ANGLED KITCHEN BROOM 12-15" Alphapoint
B.17** Alphapointe |~ P"aPOM NY-331 EA 6 $ 46.92|  NYSPsp**
SWEEPING SPAN e
ANGLED KITCHEN BROOM 12-15"
B.17 Boardwalk BWK932A 16587002 EA 1 S 8.56 ARAMSCO
SWEEPING SPAN
*|tem #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
4 of 10

** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering.




ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047 SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026) Prepared 2/14/2025

Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items. +PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

MANUFAC- MANUFACTURER NIT SIZE # UNIT TCASE PRICE
*ITEM # DESCRIPTION UFAC BRAND UFACTU VENDOR SKU v S UNITS C_ S ¢ VENDOR
TURER PART NUMBER (e.g., gal., qt.)] PER CASE | (min. order)
LOBBY DUST BROOM 8" SWEEPING PLUS BR-1021MC 26485348
B.18 ABCO EA 1 S 12.74 ARAMSCO
DUSTPAN DP-00204EH 26583474
B.19 WAREHOUSE CORN BROOM Boardwalk | Boardwalk BR10012 BWKBR10012 EA 6 S 41.59 WB MASON
DUSTPAN, METAL JANITOR -HAND HELD, .
B.20 10"-12" Janico 1092 715CNT EA 1 S 5.64| |IMPERIAL BAG
B.21 DUSTPAN, PLASTIC JANITOR-HAND HELD Janico 1089 3DSTPAN EA 1 S 2.51| [IMPERIAL BAG
BONA MULTI-SURFACE FLOOR CLEANING
CAROLINAS PAPER
B.22 PADS - 18 DISPOSABLE REFILLS AX0003641 Bona AB Bona AX0003641 AX0003641 Box of 18 1 S 24.00 SUPPLY
(NO SUBS)
SWIFFER SWEEPER WET JET MOP REFILL Procter &
B.23 rocter SWIFFER 95531 PGC08622 72/Cs 1 $ 29.37| IMPERIAL BAG
CLOTHS PGC95531 (NO SUBS) Gamble
BONA HARD SURFACE FLOOR CLEANER
CAROLINAS PAPER
B.24 LIQUID 2.5 LITER REFILL WM740215021 (NO Bona AB Bona WM700017172 WM700017172 GAL 1 S 55.00 SUPPLY
SUBS)
BONA HARD-SURFACE PREMIUM SPRAY CAROLINAS PAPER
B.25 Bona AB Bona WM710013571 WM710013571 EA 1 S 55.00
MOP KIT WM710013571 (NO SUBS) SUPPLY
WET MOP HEADS, 5" BAND, LARGE WHITE
B.26 COTTON WITH WASHABLE WEB (LOOPED ABCO ABCO LM2001XLW ABOLM2001XLW EA 12 S 54.41 WB MASON
END) STITCHING 3202
WET MOP HEADS, 5" BAND, LARGE WHITE
B.27 COTTON WITH WASHABLE WEB (LOOPED ABCO ABCO LM2001LW ABOLM2001LW EA 12 S 39.98 WB MASON
END) STITCHING 240Z
WET MOP HEADS, 5"BAND MEDIUM WHITE
B.28 COTTON W/WASHABLE WEB (LOOPED END) ABCO ABCO LM2001MW ABOLM2001MW EA 12 S 29.98 WB MASON
STITCHING 20 OZ
WET MOP HEADS, 5" BAND, SMALL WHITE
ABOLM2001WN2
B.29 COTTON W/WASHABLE WEB (LOOPED END) ABCO ABCO LM2001WN20 0 EA 12 S 27.98 WB MASON
STITCHING 16 OZ
B.30 MOP HANDLE,W/SCREW ABCO ABCO 136 BWK136 EA 1 S 4.24 WB MASON
*|tem #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
50f 10

** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering.




ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047 SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026) Prepared 2/14/2025
Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items. +PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

MANUFAC- MANUFACTURER UNIT SIZE # UNITS TCASE PRICE
*ITEM # DESCRIPTION BRAND VENDOR SKU i VENDOR
TURER PART NUMBER (e.g., gal., qt.)] PER CASE | (min. order)
WRINGER, 26 QT. PLUS BUCKET METAL WAVEBRAK
B.31 c\lNRINGER RUBBERMAID £ FG748000YEL |RUBFG748000YEL EA 1 S 72.89( HILL & MARKES

B.32 INSTITUTIONAL WRINGER PLUS BUCKET, Janico 1016 1016MB EA 1 S 102.88| |IMPERIAL BAG
PLASTIC WRINGER/STRAINER NO HANDLE

Imperial | Victori
B.33 18" RED BUFF PADS mperia Ictoria VB18RBFP VB18RBFP EA 5 $ 12.75| IMPERIAL BAG
Dade Bay
Imperial | Victori
B.34 18" BLACK STRIPPING PAD rgzzza ';:J'a VB18BSTP VB18BSTP EA 5 $ 12.75| IMPERIAL BAG
B.36 RED BUFFING PAD 20" Niagara/3M |WB Mason|  510020WB | WBM510020WB EA 5 $ 10.89|  WB MASON
B.37 BLACK STRIPPING PADS 20" Niagara/3M |WB Mason|  720020WB | WBM720020WB EA 5 $ 10.89|  WB MASON
HILL& | GENERATI
B.38 WHITE POLISHING PAD, 20 INCH 401220 GNR401220 EA 5 $ 16.35| HILL & MARKES
MARKES ON
32 07 Trigger Spray Bottle with Recycled | IMPACT
B.39-1 rigser spray Bottle with Recycle IMPACT | 5032WG-951 IMP5032WG EA 1 $ 0.64| HILL & MARKES
Content (Bottle Only) PRODUCTS
, , IMPACT
B.39-2 Trigger Mechanism for Spray Bottle IMPACT 4902 IMP4902 EA 1 S 0.67| HILL & MARKES
PRODUCTS
TRASH LINERS 23X10X39, 33GAL CLEAR 1MIL|IBS/Pit/Glopa [INT-231040] INT-231040-X-H
B.43 /Pit/Glopa VY| INT-231040-X-Hvy EA %0 |$ 20.32|  INTERBORO
MIN. MIN WGT 21#/CS - ROLLED k/Hymopack X-Hvy 1 MIL Nominal
TRASH LINERS 24X24 CLEAR 6 MICRON | IBS/Pit/Gl INT-2424-L
B.44 /Pit/Glopal |\ 1 424t , , INT-2424-L EA 1,000 | $ 10.32|  INTERBORO
HDPE, MIN WGT 9.1#/CS - ROLLED k/Hymopack 6 Mic. Noninal
TRASH LINERS 24X33 CLEAR 10 MICRON | Imperial | Victori
B.45 mperia ICtona | \BLH243055¢C | VBLH243055C EA %0 | 6.35| IMPERIAL BAG
HDPE - ROLLED Dade Bay

TRASH LINERS 33X40 CLEAR 11 MICRON | IBS/Pit/Glopa| INT-3340- | INT-3340-Med
B.46 /Pit/Glopa , € INT-3340-Med EA 500 | ¢ 2034|  INTERBORO
HDPE - ROLLED k/Hymopack Med 11 Mic. nominal

*|tem #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 6 of 10



ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047 SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026)

Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items.

Prepared 2/14/2025

+PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

MANUFAC- MANUFACTURER NITSIZE | #uNiTs | +CASE PRICE
*ITEM # DESCRIPTION UFAC- 1 BraND UFACTU venborsku | UNITS UNITS '} +CASE PRIC VENDOR
TURER PART NUMBER (e.g., gal., qt.)] PER CASE | (min. order)
TRASH LINERS 43X48 CLEAR 22 MICRON | IBS/Pit/Glopa| INT-4348- |  INT-4348-XH
B.47 /Pit/Glopa , , INT-4348-XH EA 200 | 21.10|  INTERBORO
HDPE - ROLLED k/Hymopack XH 22 Mic. nominal
INT-221658-Super
TRASH LINER 22X16X58 OR 60,2.3 MIL  |IBS/Pit/Glopa |INT-221658 INT-221658-S
B.48 /Pit/Glopa Exh uper EA 100 | 25.15|  INTERBORO
CLEAR, MIN WGT 33#/CS - ROLLED k/Hymopack | Super Exh . Exh
2.3 MIL hominal
TRASH LINER 22X16X58 OR 60, 2.3 MIL | IBS/Pit/Glopa |INT-221658] V| 2210°8-5uPer| o 5> 1658-super
B.49 < P XXH P EA 100 | 28.48|  INTERBORO
BLACK/GREY, MIN WGT 33#/CS - ROLLED | k/Hymopack | Super XXH , XXH
2.3 MIL Nominal
TRASH BAGS 1 MIL MIN. 23"X20"X46" | I1BS/Pit/Glopa [INT-232046 INT-232046-H
B.50 /Pit/Glopa VY INT-232046-Hvy EA 100 |3 10.98|  INTERBORO
CLEAR, MIN WGT 13# - ROLLED k/Hymopack Hvy 1 MIL Nominal
PRO103483 VACUUM BAG FOR PROFORCE
B.51 ProTeam | ProTeam | PRO103483 16042234 10/PACK 1 $ 877  ARAMSCO
(OR EQUIV)
B.52 PRO107377 VACUUM BAG (OR EQUIV) ProTeam | ProTeam | PRO107377 PRO107377 10/PACK 1 $ 11.38| HILL & MARKES
TRANSLUCENT CUPS 9 OZ. (BOARDWALK | Imperial | Victori
B.53 ( mperia Ictoria VBPPOCUP VBPPOCUP EA 2500 | ¢ 49.30| IMPERIAL BAG
POLYPROPYLENE OR EQUIV) Dade Bay
PAPER CUPS FOR DISPENSER, EQUIV SIZE et
B.54 (for dispenser) of Boardwalk 9 oz Chef's Supply [ " HCPLA10 CSIHCPLA10 50/PK 20 $ 5598 WB MASON
Polypropylene cups PPl
HAIR-NETS (BLACK) DISPOSABLE - SINGLE HNC
B.55 ( ) : HC-HNL-BK HAIRNET 144/BOX 1 $ 9.00| IMPERIAL BAG
USE Enterprises
INSTANT HAND SANITIZER 40Z PUMP
B.56 WB Mason | WB Mason NWLHS0424 402 1 $ 1.63|  WB MASON
BOTTLE
INSTANT HAND SANITIZER 80Z PUMP
B.57 WB Mason | WB Mason NWLHS0812 80z 1 $ 2.06| W8 MASON
BOTTLE
ALCOHOL-FREE HAND SANITIZER DISPENSER Clairo
B.58 REFILL (MUST FIT CLARIO 91831-92 Betco Alcohol- 7522900 75229 1000 ML 6 $ 55.20| IMPERIAL BAG
DISPENSER) Free
HAND SANITIZER DISPENSER REFILL (MUST CAROLINAS PAPER
B.59 ( Betco Betco BCC79519 BCC79519 800 ML 6 $  143.00
FIT CLARIO 91831-92 DISPENSER) SUPPLY
*|tem #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
7 of 10

** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering.




ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047 SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026) Prepared 2/14/2025
Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items. +PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

MANUFAC- MANUFACTURER UNIT SIZE # UNITS TCASE PRICE
*ITEM # DESCRIPTION BRAND VENDOR SKU . VENDOR
TURER PART NUMBER (e.g., gal., qt.)] PER CASE | (min. order)
HAND SANITIZER DISPENSER REFILL (MUST GOJO FMX-12
B.60-1 FIT PURELL (FMX-12) GOJ512006 Industries Hand 5192-04 519204 1200 ML 4 S 82.28 IMPERIAL BAG
DISPENSER) Sanitizer
PURELL DISPENSER (FMX-12) (NO SUBS GOJO
B.60-2 ( i ) . Purell G0J512006 5120-06 EA 1 FREE IMPERIAL BAG
G0J512006 Industries

HAND-SANITIZER DISPENSER REFILL (MUST
B.61 ( Kutol 5666 16368060 800 ML 12 S 53.75 ARAMSCO
FIT KUT5666 DISPENSER)

FOAMING HAND SOAP DISPENSER REFILL

B.62 Kutol 69041 26761282 1000 ML 6 S 42.65 ARAMSCO
KUTOL (MUST FIT KUT69041 DISPENSER)
SOAP, LIQUID HAND SOAP DISPENSER KUTOL
B.63 REFILL KUTOL HEALTH GUARD 7227 (OR KUTOL HEALTH 7227 KUT7227 1000 ML 10 S 40.00| HILL & MARKES
EQUIV) GUARD
KUTOL
B.64 HAND SOAP, LIQUID 1 GALLON KUTOL HEALTH 69009 KUT69009 GAL 4 S 38.40| HILL & MARKES
GUARD
HEAVY-DUTY ORANGE TRASH BAGS. LOW IBS/Pit/Glopa | INT-4348 INT-4348- INT-4348
B.65 DENSITY PLASTIC, 23 MIL, 42-48 GAL, FOR P Super Exh EA 100 S 49.68 INTERBORO
k/Hymopack | Super Exh . ) Super Exh
ROADSIDE TRASH COLLECTION 3Mil Nominal
US5800GGB
NITRILE POWDER FREE GLOVES, 23 MIL SM- US5801GGB
B.66 Rensow Rensow US5800GGB 100/BOX 10 S 24.86 UNITED SALES
XL US5802GGB
US5803GGB
Automotive ATSP1710
NITRILE POWDER FREE GLOVES, 26 MIL SM- . P1710 P1711 ATSP1711
B.67 Service WB Mason 100/BOX 1 S 7.60 WB MASON
XL BLACK only P1712 P1713 ATSP1712
Products
ATSP1713

Category C: Janitorial Paper Products

C1 FACIAL TISSUE (100 TISSUE/BOX) 8"X8" Santoray Santoray US4211CPGB US4211CPGB 100/BOX 30 S 14.10( UNITED SALES
TOILET TISSUE ,1 PLY INDIV. WRAPPED 1000 1000
C.2 ” Atlas Atlas US115APM US115APM 96 S 41.29| UNITED SALES
SHEETS/ROLL, 4-1/2” WIDE ROLLS sheets/roll

*|tem #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 80f 10



ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047 SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026) Prepared 2/14/2025
Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items. +PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

MANUFAC- MANUFACTURER UNIT SIZE # UNITS TCASE PRICE
*ITEM # DESCRIPTION BRAND VENDOR SKU ) VENDOR
TURER PART NUMBER (e.g., gal., qt.)] PER CASE | (min. order)
TOILET TISSUE, 2 PLY INDIV. WRAPPED 500 400
C3 ) Atlas Atlas APM248GREEN US4229CPGB 96 S 27.97 UNITED SALES
SHEETS/ROLL, 4-1/2” WIDE ROLLS sheets/roll
JUMBO TOILET TISSUE, 2 PLY 3.3" CORE,
C4 e . Atlas Atlas US700APM US700APM 1000’ roll 12 S 26.32 UNITED SALES
3.5"X9" 1000' PER ROLL
JUMBO TOILET PAPER, 2-PLY, 1400' L X 3.5" .
C.5 < 12" Nittany NP-TT2P12 NPTT2P12 1200’ roll 6 S 25.00 IMPERIAL BAG
DISPOSABLE TOILET SEAT COVERS IMPACT Impact Impact
C.7 PRODUCTS 25188173 LEVER DISPENSED (NO P P 25188173 16898342 3000/BOX 1 S 55.96 ARAMSCO
Products Products
SUBS)
DISPOSABLE TOILET SEAT COVERS MUST FIT | t | t
cs mpac mpac 25187973 16888341 5000/BOX 1 $ 71.74|  ARAMSCO
IMP 25183273 Products Products
C.9 C' FOLD TOWEL 10 10"X12 3/4" Santoray Santoray us4002G us4002G 200/PACK 12 S 17.10 UNITED SALES
MULTIFOLD TOWEL WHITE ONLY, 91/2" X9
C.10 1/4" / Santoray Santoray US5301NP US5301NP 250/PACK 16 S 17.83 UNITED SALES
CASCADES PRO CAS-T115 PERFORM™
C.11 STANDARD 1-PLY TOWEL ROLL, 775' x 7.5", | Cascades Inc.| Cascades T115 CSD1358 775 FT 6 S 45.49 WB MASON
NATURAL (NO SUBS), for electronic
SINGLE ROLL HARDWOUND TOWELS, Marcal
C.12 MARCAL PRO MRCP708B, 800' x 7.88" (NO Marcal PRO MRCP708B MRCP708B 800 FT 6 S 24.50 WB MASON
SUBS)
DISPENSER FOR SINGLE ROLL, ESSITY 87T
C.13 GEN GEN 1605 GEN1605 1 1 S 38.24 WB MASON
(OR EQUIV)
KITCHEN ROLL TOWEL 84/RL WHITE,
C.14 " " / Marcal Marcal 6350 MRC06350 85 SHT/RL 30 S 23.87 WB MASON
11"X8.8" 2 PLY
TORK BASIC PAPER WIPER 192125A (NO
C.15 SUBS) ( Essity Tork 192125A 192125A 110/BOX 18 S 35.99 IMPERIAL BAG
TORK INDUSTRIAL WIPER 440245A (NO
C.16 SUBS) ( Essity Tork 440245A 440245A 90/BOX 10 S 50.60 IMPERIAL BAG

*|tem #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 90f10



ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047 SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026)
TPRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items.

Prepared 2/14/2025

MANUFAC- MANUFACTURER NITSIZE | #uNiTs | +CASE PRICE
*ITEM # DESCRIPTION UFAC- 1 BraND UFACTU venborsku | UNITS UNITS '} +CASE PRIC VENDOR
TURER PART NUMBER (e.g., gal., qt.)] PER CASE | (min. order)
C.17 TORK PAPER WIPER 303362 (NO SUBS) Essity Tork 303362 303362 125/BOX 8 $ 63.86| IMPERIAL BAG
Imperial | Victori
c.18 #8 GROCERY BAGS BROWN "I’Dzzza ';:J'a VB8SOB VB8SOB Bundle 500 | ¢ 10.58| IMPERIAL BAG
Imperial | Victori
.19 #20 TALL BROWN PAPER BAGS rgzzza ';:J'a VB20SOB VB20SOB Bundle 500 | ¢ 17.17| IMPERIAL BAG
Imperial | Victori
C.20 #20 TALL WHITE PAPER BAGS rgzzza ';:J'a VB20SOBW VB20SOBW Bundle 500 | S 27.00| IMPERIAL BAG
Category D: Feminine Hygiene Products
LINER FOR SANIT.NAPKIN o
D.2 RECEPTACLE,KRAFT,WAXED BAG 7.5”x Hospeco | [°2"! KL 260SANBAG EA 500 | ¢ 20.25| IMPERIAL BAG
10.25"X3.5"
INDIVIDUAL SANITARY NAPKIN DISPOSAL CAROLINAS PAPER
D.3 L TS BagCraft | BagCraft | 72181003149 | 72181003149 EA 1000 | $ 57.60
BAGS,KRAFT,WAXED BAG 4”x 2.25”X9 SUPPLY
*|tem #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
10 of 10

** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering.



REQUEST FOR BIDS

for

SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

Issued by:

In collaboration with Orange, Rockland & Chemung
Counties

PROCURE L&
CONNECT®

Solicitation Number: RFB-UC24-047

Bids for the above referenced solicitation number and title will be received
until 2:30 PM on Friday, December 27, 2024 via electronic solicitation
submission accessed through BIDNET DIRECT or by physical submission
delivered to the Ulster County Purchasing Department.




COUNTY OF ULSTER - PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
100 DEVELOPMENT COURT, KINGSTON, NY 12401
PHONE: 845-340-3400 / FAX: 845-340-3434 / WEB: www.ulstercountyny.gov/purchasing

BID NAME: SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES ‘ BID NO. RFB-UC24-047 ‘ -2-

INVITATION TO BID AND NOTICE TO BIDDERS

DATE: December 6, 2024

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT SEALED BIDS ARE SOUGHT AND REQUESTED FOR
THE FOLLOWING:

BID NAME: SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
BID NUMBER: RFB-UC24-047

PLACE OF OPENING:  Ulster County Purchasing,
100 Development Court
Kingston, NY 12401

DATE OF OPENING: December 27, 2024
TIME OF OPENING: 2:30 P.M.

CONTACT PERSON: Frances Wu; Principal Buyer
Phone: 845-340-3408
Email: frwu@co.ulster.ny.us

It is the bidder's responsibility to read the attached Bid Specifications and GENERAL CONDITIONS, which
outline bidding rules of the Ulster County Purchasing Department. Upon submission of bid, it is understood
that the bidder has read, fully understands and will comply with said GENERAL CONDITIONS and
specification requirements.

IMPORTANT NOTICE: Bid distribution - Copies of Bid Documents obtained from any source
other than directly from Ulster County are not considered official copies. Only those bidders who
obtain bidding documents from Ulster County Purchasing or the Ulster County website are
guaranteed to receive addendum information if issued. If you have obtained this document from a
source other than Ulster County Purchasing or its website, it is recommended that you obtain
an official copy.

By: Edward Jordan, Director of Purchasing

PLEASE RETAIN THE BID DOCUMENT FOR YOUR RECORDS



COUNTY OF ULSTER - PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
100 DEVELOPMENT COURT, KINGSTON, NY 12401
PHONE: 845-340-3400 / FAX: 845-340-3434 / WEB: www.ulstercountyny.gov/purchasing

BID NAME: SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES BID NO. RFB-UC24-047 -21-

43.0

44.0

45.0

Bid pages pertaining to products, vendor delivery, and sustainability requirements:

MINIMUM ORDERS

All ordering Departments/Agencies will be directed to order a minimum of $40.00 per delivery
whenever possible. At the discretion of the Vendor, a “small order charge” of not more than $5.00
may be added to orders that do not meet the $40.00 minimum requirement. However, before the vendor
can assess a small order charge, the ordering department must be notified and given the opportunity to
increase their order or avoid the charge in some other way. Prices quoted shall include delivery costs.

RESTOCKING

Ulster County and the Alliance shall pay no more than 10% for a restocking charge on items that have
been incorrectly ordered by the department. Items must be returned in original cartons in resalable
condition. County departments will be advised to inspect all orders immediately upon receipt and
notify the vendor of any damage or mistakes within ten (10) days of receipt of order.

SUSTAINABILITY REQUIREMENTS

Ulster County is firmly committed to sustainability and environmental responsibility. As directed by
Executive Order #1 of 2023 (https://ulstercountyny.gov/environment/department-environment)
issued by the County Executive, adherence to GreenNY sustainability requirements is now a
fundamental aspect of our procurement process.



COUNTY OF ULSTER - PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
100 DEVELOPMENT COURT, KINGSTON, NY 12401
PHONE: 845-340-3400 / FAX: 845-340-3434 / WEB: www.ulstercountyny.gov/purchasing

BID NAME: SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES BID NO. RFB-UC24-047 -22-

46.0

Ulster County has qualified to achieve certification as a New York State Green Purchasing
Community. The County’s sustainability initiative is designed to apply across a broad range of
products and services. Suppliers are advised to review the GreenNY sustainability requirements
(https://ogs.ny.gov/greenny-purchasing-requirements-and-tools), familiarize themselves with the
County’s initiatives aimed at mitigating the environmental footprint of its operations, and embrace
the principles of environmental stewardship.

DELIVERY REGIONS

Please note, current Empire Procure Connect Members Ulster, Orange, and Rockland Counties are
located in Region 4. Current Empire Procure Connect Member Chemung County is located in
Region 8. The Alliance anticipates that new Municipal Members will join the Alliance during this
contract period. The resulting contract award is anticipated to be used by municipalities throughout
New York State.

Region Area Counties

Region 1 Long Island Nassau, Suffolk

Region 2 New York City Bronx, Kings (Brooklyn), New York, Queens, Richmond
(Staten Island)

Region 3 Hudson Valley East Dutchess, Putnam, Westchester

Region 4 Hudson Valley West Rockland, Orange, Ulster, Sullivan

Region 5 Albany/Capital Albany, Columbia, Delaware, Fulton, Greene, Montgomery,
Otsego, Rensselaer, Schenectady, Schoharie

Region 6 Adirondack Clinton, Essex, Franklin, Hamilton, Saratoga, Warren,
Washington

Region 7 Syracuse Cayuga, Herkimer, Jefferson, Lewis, Madison, Oneida,

Onondaga, Oswego, St. Lawrence

Region 8 Finger Lakes Broome, Chemung, Chenango, Cortland, Livingston, Monroe,

Ontario, Schuyler, Seneca, Steuben, Tioga, Tompkins,
Wayne, Yates

Region 9 Buffalo Allegany, Cattaraugus, Chautauqua, Erie, Genesee, Niagara,

Orleans, Wyoming

47.0

MANDATORY SPECIFICATIONS AND DESIRABLE CRITERIA

Per Ulster County Resolution No. 282 0f 2010 and 2023 Ulster County Procurement Manual Section X
Sustainable Purchasing, cleaning products used in County facilities shall meet the GreenNY or Green
Seal GS-37 standard, or equivalent.

For all items in this bid, PACKAGING must comply with Environmental Conservation Law section
37-0205. Packaging shall not contain inks, dyes, pigments, adhesives, stabilizers, or any other
additives to which any lead, cadmium, mercury, or hexavalent chromium is intentionally added or
contain incidental concentrations of lead, cadmium, mercury, or hexavalent chromium which
together are greater than 100 parts per million by weight (0.01%).



https://legislature.ulstercountyny.gov/sites/default/files/documents/282-10.pdf

COUNTY OF ULSTER - PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
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47.1 CLEANING, FACILITY MAINTENANCE CHEMICALS, DISINFECTANTS AND SANITIZERS

This category of products includes a wide variety of concentrated and ready-to-use (RTU) products and
wipes, as well as related dispensing equipment.

This category is divided into the sub-categories listed below.
47.1a) Cleaning and Facility Maintenance Chemicals

This sub-category includes a variety of chemical cleaners, facility maintenance, and deicing and
snowmelt products

Mandatory Specifications
1) All products offered in this category must currently have one of the following certifications:

e (GreenSeal: https://www.greenseal.org. Products may  be viewed at
https://www.greenseal.org/certified-products-services.

e UL ECOLOGO: https://www.ul.com/resources/ecologo-certification-program. Products
may be viewed at https://spot.ul.com.

e US EPA Safer Choice: https://www.epa.gov/saferchoice. Products may be viewed at
https://www.epa.gov/saferchoice/products. This excludes all products where the parent
company is overdue for their yearly partnership review and is identified with a double
dagger (}) next to the company name in the safer choice product list.

2) To verify compliance with the required certifications listed above, links must be provided in the
bid sheet to the certifier’s website, the Clear Roads QPL, the UL SPOT website, or the
Ecomedes website (https://products.ecomedes.com/).

3) No products in this category may be offered in aerosol containers.

4) No products in this category shall contain polyvinyl chloride (PVC) or Per- and polyfluoroalkyl
substances (PFAS).

47.1b) Disinfectants, Sanitizers, Food-Contact Surface Sanitizers

This category includes surface and laundry disinfectants that can kill COVID-19, bloodborne
pathogens, mold and mildew, and other types of bacteria, viruses and fungi. It also includes food-
contact and non-food-contact surface sanitizers.

This category excludes hand sanitizers and antimicrobial hand soaps, which are identified in
section 38.2, below) as well as products that are designed to kill pathogens on medical instruments or
equipment. snowmelt products.

Mandatory Specifications

1) All products offered in this category must meet the same Mandatory Specifications specified in
“la) Cleaning and Facility Maintenance Chemicals”

2) Must be EPA-registered and included on EPA List N, confirming efficacy against COVID-19.

e To verify compliance, EPA registration number must be provided in the bid sheet and
confirmed by bidder using the EPA List N Tool.



https://www.greenseal.org/
https://www.greenseal.org/certified-products-services
https://www.ul.com/resources/ecologo-certification-program
https://spot.ul.com/
https://www.epa.gov/saferchoice
https://www.epa.gov/saferchoice/products
https://products.ecomedes.com/
https://cfpub.epa.gov/wizards/disinfectants/
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47.2 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT

This category includes but is not limited to supplies and equipment such as brooms, microfiber mops
and wiping rags, sponges and scrubbers, gloves, hand soap, hand sanitizer, disposable plastic clear and
dark trash can liners listed below. No products shall contain polyvinyl chloride (PVC) or
per/polyfluoroalkyl substances (PFAS).

47.2a) Cleaning Supplies, Equipment and Service

This sub-category includes brooms, mops, sorbents, sponges and scrubbers, wastebaskets and recycling
containers, cloth wiping rags, personal protective equipment, and other janitorial products.

Brooms and Broom/Mop Handles

e Broom handles, attached or purchased separately, shall be made of wood, metal, or plastic and
shall not contain polyvinyl chloride (PVC). Wood cannot come from sources considered
endangered or threatened by CITES.

e No feather dusters allowed.

e Desirable: It is desirable to offer brooms made of plant-based material (except for binding
materials and coatings) and recycled content.

Flooring Pads

e Must be Green Seal certified.

Gloves

e All disposable and reusable gloves shall be free of PVC and latex.

e Desirable: Certified compostable options.

Mops/Mopheads

All wet mops and dust mops shall use reusable mop pads or heads that are the following:

e Certified by Green Seal or, if microfiber, must use microfibers that measure less than 1 denier in
diameter.

e No products may contain polyvinyl chloride (PVC).
Sponges and Scrubbers

All hand sponges and scrubbers shall be 100% cellulose or another plant-based fiber OR contain a
minimum of 20% post-consumer recycled material.

Wastebaskets and Recycling Containers

e All waste baskets and recycling containers must comply with the US Environmental Protection
Agency’s Comprehensive Procurement Guidelines for Office Recycling Containers and Waste
Receptacles, available at http://www.epa.gov/osw/conserve/tools/cpg/products/office.htm.:

o If plastic, contain at least 20% post-consumer recycled content (PCRC).

o If steel, contain at least 16% PCRC.


https://cites.org/eng/search?search_api_fulltext=endangered&f%5B0%5D=content_type%3Atimber_id_material
http://www.epa.gov/osw/conserve/tools/cpg/products/office.htm

PHONE: 845-340-3400 / FAX: 845-340-3434 / WEB: www.ulstercountyny.gov/purchasing
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o If corrugated cardboard, contain at least 25% PCRC.
e No PVC is permitted.
Wiping Rags, Cloth

All reusable cloth wiping rags shall be made of reused material or recycled-content fabric with a
minimum of 10% post-consumer recycled content.

No wiping rags may be “pretreated” with mineral oil or other chemicals.

Must not be split microfiber.

Desirable: It is desirable to offer microfiber that measures less than 1 denier in diameter.

Desirable: Microfiber cloths that are flat woven/knit are preferred over terry/velour.

Other Janitorial Products

It is desirable for other miscellaneous janitorial supplies not specified above (including, but not
limited to, composting containers, dust pans, spray bottles, steel wool, toilet bowl brushes) to
contain a minimum of 10% post-consumer recycled content or are determined to be
environmentally preferable by an independent third party organization such as the Forest
Stewardship Council, BPI, CMA, Cradle to Cradle, US EPA, USDA, UL, Green Seal, etc. Must
provide a link to the certification from the third-party website or from the Ecomedes website
(https://products.ecomedes.com/) in the bid sheet to verify compliance with any third-party

certification. For recycled content bidders are strongly encouraged to provide documentation such
as a link to a tech sheet for the product.

47.2b) Hand soaps and personal care products (non-antimicrobial)

This sub-category includes non-antimicrobial hand soaps (both foams and lotions), hair shampoos, and
body washes and related dispensers, as well as hand sanitizers (liquids, gels and wipes) and related

dispensers.

All hand soaps, body and hair products must meet the following criteria;

Contain NO antimicrobial agents.

All products offered in this category must currently have at least one of the following
certifications:

(0]

Green Seal:  https://www.greenseal.org. Products may be viewed at
https://www.ereenseal.org/certified-products-services.

UL ECOLOGQO https://www.ul.com/resources/ecologo-certification-program. Products may
be viewed at https://spot.ul.com.

US EPA Safer Choice: https://www.epa.gov/saferchoice. Products may be viewed at
https://www.epa.gov/saferchoice/products. This excludes all products where the parent
company is overdue for their yearly partnership review and is identified with a double
dagger (1) next to the company name in the safer choice product list.

May offer foaming and liquid hand soap options.


https://products.ecomedes.com/
https://www.greenseal.org/
https://www.greenseal.org/certified-products-services
https://www.ul.com/resources/ecologo-certification-program
https://spot.ul.com/
https://www.epa.gov/saferchoice
https://www.epa.gov/saferchoice/products
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It is encouraged to provide and install dispensers free of charge and bidders should provide
information in the Bidder Response Form regarding their offering. Battery free options
preferred.

To verify compliance with the required certifications listed above, links must be provided in the
bid sheet to the certifier’s website, the Clear Roads QPL, the UL SPOT website, or the
Ecomedes website (https://products.ecomedes.com/).

47.2c¢) Antimicrobial Hand Sanitizers and Hand Washes (including liquid, gel and foam
formulations)

All hand sanitizers offered on this contract must meet the following criteria:

Be legally marketed and not misbranded under the FDA Monograph for Consumer Antiseptic
Hand Rub Products. (84 FR 14847 Consumer Antiseptic Rubs Final Rule and any subsequent
amendments, updated 2019.)

Hand sanitizers (only) must contain at least 60% alcohol per the Centers for Disease Control
(CDC) guidance which can be accessed at: https://www.cdc.gov/handwashing/when-how-
handwashing.html.

May not be on the US Food and Drug Administration’s (FDA’s) Hand Sanitizer Do-Not-Use
List which may be viewed at: https://www.fda.gov/drugs/drug-safety-and-availability/fda-
updates-hand-sanitizers-consumers-should-not-use. This list includes products that are
dangerous because they are found or likely to be contaminated with methanol or 1-propanol or
that are packaged in food or drink containers.

Preferred to contain the following third-party certification:

o Green Seal

o UL ECOLOGO

o Cradle to Cradle

Preferred to contain ethyl alcohol or isopropyl alcohol active ingredients only.
Preferred to be USDA Biobased, fragrance-free, and dye-free.

It is encouraged to provide and install dispensers free of charge and bidders should provide
information in the Bidder Response Form regarding their offering.

47.3¢c) Trash Bags

This sub-category includes disposable plastic and paper can liners used primarily for janitorial
applications in institutional settings, including trash, recycling, and yard waste composting. It also
includes compostable bio-plastic bags designed to collect food and/or yard waste for composting. All
must, to the extent practicable:

Meet New York State’s guidelines which restrict toxics in packaging (established in
Environmental Conservation Law section 37-0205), meaning that the bags themselves and
any of their components do not contain inks, dyes, pigments, adhesives, stabilizers, or any
other additives to which any lead, cadmium, mercury, or hexavalent chromium is


https://products.ecomedes.com/
https://www.cdc.gov/handwashing/when-how-handwashing.html
https://www.cdc.gov/handwashing/when-how-handwashing.html
https://www.cdc.gov/handwashing/when-how-handwashing.html.
https://www.cdc.gov/handwashing/when-how-handwashing.html.
https://www.fda.gov/drugs/drug-safety-and-availability/fda-updates-hand-sanitizers-consumers-should-not-use
https://www.fda.gov/drugs/drug-safety-and-availability/fda-updates-hand-sanitizers-consumers-should-not-use
https://www.fda.gov/drugs/drug-safety-and-availability/fda-updates-hand-sanitizers-consumers-should-not-use
https://www.fda.gov/drugs/drug-safety-and-availability/fda-updates-hand-sanitizers-consumers-should-not-use
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intentionally added, or do not contain incidental concentrations of lead, cadmium, mercury,

or hexavalent chromium which together are greater than 100 parts per million by weight
(0.01%).

Contain no intentionally added antimicrobial ingredients or chlorinated compounds (e.g.,
polyvinyl chloride (PVC) or vinylidene chloride).

Contain no intentionally added fragrances or phthalates.

Disposable Plastic Trash/Recycling Can Liners

All non-compostable plastic trash/recycling can liners (i.e., bags) shall contain at least 10%
post-consumer recycled content®, which complies with Green NY Specifications
https://ogs.ny.gov/greenny/trash-bags.

*30% PCRC is preferred and may be selected if the price is within 15% of the lowest
responsive, responsible bid.

Must not be labeled “oxo-biodegradable” or “oxo-degradable.”
Must not contain intentionally added antimicrobial ingredients, chlorinated compounds (e.g.

PVC), or fragrances.

Have a maximum thickness of 10 microns or less, if the bag is smaller than 13 gallons.

Desirable: Products with a third-party certification for recycled content (e.g., UL ECOLOGO,
SCS Recycled Content Verification, Cradle to Cradle Innovation Institute).

Compostable Organic Waste Bags

Certified compostable (in a commercial composting facility) by the Biodegradable Products
Institute (BPI), the Composting Manufacturing Alliance, or another organization under an
equivalent or stronger compostability standard (e.g., European Union DIN or Vincotte).

Have the BPI or equivalent logo as well as the word “COMPOSTABLE” printed on the bag.

47.3: JANITORIAL PAPER

This category includes toilet paper, paper towels, toilet seat covers, facial tissues, table napkins,
industrial paper wipes, as well as related dispensing equipment. Listed below are detailed subcategory
descriptions.

e Products shall be Processed Chlorine Free. Additionally, chlorine or chlorine derivatives (e.g.,
elemental chlorine, chlorine dioxide, sodium hypochlorite, sodium chlorite) shall not be used
during the following steps of the papermaking process: re-pulping, screening, deinking, and
washing.

e Toilet Paper, Paper Towels, and Facial Tissue must contain 100% Total Recycled Content and
meet the minimum post-consumer recycled content below:

o Toilet Paper 20% PCRC.
o Paper Towels 40% PCRC.


https://ogs.ny.gov/greenny/trash-bags
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o Facial Tissue 10% PCRC.

Paper Napkins, Toilet Seat Covers, and Industrial Wipes must meet the meet the minimum post-
consumer recycled content below (100% TRC is desired but not required):

o Paper Napkins 30% PCRC.
o Toilet Seat Covers 20% PCRC.
o Industrial Wipes 40% PCRC.

Contain NO antimicrobial ingredients, fragrances, colorants (pigments or dyes), or alkylphenol
ethoxylates, other alkylphenol derivatives (APEOs), or nanomaterials.

Desirable: Certified by at least one of the following:

o Green Seal: https://www.greenseal.org. (satisfies chemical content/processing restrictions,
but not TRC/PCRC).

o UL ECOLOGO https://www.ul.com/resources/ecologo-certification-program. . (satisfies
alkylphenol restrictions but not others).

Must provide a link to the certification from the third-party website or from the Ecomedes
website (https://products.ecomedes.com/) in the bid sheet to verify compliance.

It is encouraged to provide and install dispensers free of charge and bidders should provide
information in the Bidder Response Form regarding their offering.

47.4: FEMININE HYGIENE PRODUCTS

Mandatory Specifications

Products contain NO antimicrobial ingredients, fragrances, nanomaterials, or dyes, unbleached,
or bleached with totally chlorine free processes. (Note: elemental chlorine free, or ECF, does not
qualify because it uses chlorine derivatives.) Must be carbon-disulfide-free.

Pads must have 100% cotton top layer, and core layer must be 100% cotton or Wood
Pulp/Cellulose that is rayon-free and TCF or unbleached.

Tampons must be 100% cotton and contain recycled cardboard applicator or none.


https://www.greenseal.org/
https://www.ul.com/resources/ecologo-certification-program
https://products.ecomedes.com/
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